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How to get here 
 
By Air: 
 
Midtjyllands Lufthavn in Karup is the only airport near Viborg. Not a lot of foreign airports have 
flights to Karup. So often you will have to change at the Copenhagen Airport. To get a cheap 
ticket from Copenhagen to Karup you have to book your ticket early. Tickets can be booked at 
the following website:  www.momondo.dk – sometimes you will be able to get a very cheap flight 
– even cheaper than the bus and train. 
 
Teletaxa 
From Midtjyllands Lufthavn you have to take a “Teletaxa” to Viborg Bus/train station. Teletaxa 
must be booked at least an hour in advance at phone no. +45 8740 8396 - press 3 for Teletaxa. 
The price is about. Dkr 40,00 / Euro 5,5 per person. Please be aware that the driver only accepts 
Danish currency.  Teletaxa leaves about 15 minutes after planned arrival from the Airport, if your 
plane is delayed please call Teletaxa with the information. To find “your” Teletaxa you have to 
look for a sign outside the Airport where it says Teletaxa.  
Please be aware that the first Teletaxa will leave from the airport to Viborg at 06.00 in the morn-
ing at the last one to Viborg at 23.30 in the evening. If you arrive sooner or later to have to take 
an ordinary taxi is the price about Dkr. 300-400 / Euro 40-53. 
 
 
Aarhus Airport, if you arrive to Aarhus airport you must take a bus from the airport to the centre 
of Aarhus (http://www.aar.dk/default.asp?id=83) and then the train from Aarhus to Viborg. 
 
Billund Airport, if you arrive to Billund airport you must take a bus from the airport to the centre 
of Aarhus (http://www.bll.dk/til-lufthavnen/busser) and then the train from Aarhus to Viborg. 
 
 
Ålborg Airport, if you arrive to Ålborg airport you must take a bus from the airport to the centre 
of Ålborg (http://www.p-henvisning.dk/parkering-aalborg-lufthavn/) and then the bus from Ål-
borg to Viborg (https://www.midttrafik.dk/koereplaner/x-busser/koereplaner/x-busser-der-
koerer-i-midttrafiks-omraade/960x-silkeborg-viborg-aalborg/koereplan).  
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You can also take the bus from Copenhagen to Viborg: 
 
Flixbus, This bus leaves from the airport or from the main train station (Hovedbanegaarden) in 
Copenhagen Flixbus - remember when you take this bus to buy a student ticket and bring your 
student card. 
 
 
By Train: 
 
Train:  There is a train once an hour from the Copenhagen airport to Jutland. The trip by train 
takes 5 hours and often you have to change once, often in Århus or Langå. You will find more in-
formation at the following website: www.rejseplanen.dk . So if you prefer train to bus, or if you 
have a long wait for the bus, check the train times.  

https://www.flixbus.dk/?_ga=2.214485975.1963958751.1512397298-576594663.1502706667&_gac=1.19950282.1512397298.Cj0KCQiAgZTRBRDmARIsAJvVWAtB07oRA3IQm7FYilHl2kWV4fRq3IUmlWAw-Noy8hFNv2LQQweYAIMaAmdTEALw_wcB
http://www.rejseplanen.dk/

